
(Contract Management Use only) 

CONTRACTAPPROVALFORM 
2012 OCT -3 MliO: I 0 

CONTRACT 
TRACKING NO. 

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION 
Q.IY\ I 1). 

Name: Co fax 

Address: 6631 N Executive Park Court, Suite 210 
City Jacksonville State FL Zip 32216 

Contractor's Administrator Name:_-"R"ic,h,.a"rdecD""urcea"'nt'------------ Title: Education and Government Sales 

Tel#: 904-296-1600 Fax: 904-296-7111 Email: _ _.,Ri"' c,l,la"'rd.,.D""'ura'""'nt,.,@,.C"o"'p"'y"F"a"x . .,co,m"'-----------

., . .. CONTRACT INFORMATION 
Contract Name: Vu._.t.>0, ( 0\~>\ (, v"' ( ((l_c:::~(_, 0 .. -nd, v-c,ctir-, ( {f't.(\ CL .. ,~ 
ContractValue: $11.323.80 (36MonthLease) b''-.0'-f \ 7<q_<-;< .;..'flD}t"--1'~-~:,) l..L-tth"-'-' _ :.,", r ~ ?)(\ !c.t,k j'<--'\.(\ __ ;:,"J-· ..J .-> (.( __ ep~v 

Brief Description: RICOH MPSOOSP Copier; PB3130 Paper Feed Unit; 
SR3120 Stapler/Finisher; Bridge Unit BU3060; Punch Unit PU3000; Fax Option; Base Monthly Cost 

Contract Dates: From: _01/01/2013_to _12/31/2015 __ 
Status: New X Renew Amend# WA/Task Order 
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How Procured: Sole Source _Single Source _ITB _ RFP _RFQ _Coop. _Other ___ T"-7 __ 

If Processing an Amendment: 

Contract#: Increase Amount of Existing Contract: No Increase 
New Contract Dates: to TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT: ----e-cc--------

e ' APP~OV ~ Pur'lUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6 

1. ~b ~ Ll./V~ D11 'J.'J.S/'3 ~ sl./ifooo 
epartment Head Signature Date Funding Source/Ace!# 

2. t6.A~, \ UJ lo·ao~l..cl- 0\I'J.';;l.513-5/.f.fc£J~{) 
Contract Managemi\Qi) ~ "3 Date 

3. 
Date 

4. '2- - 'l.. I - }1..-
Date 

Comments:-------------------------------------

-FINAL SIGNATURE APPROVAL 

;!J-?-r /r r 
Ted Selby Date 

RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: 

Revised 9124/2012 

Original: Clerk's Services; Contmctor (original or certified copy) ::JjQ t\Ut 
S\ \'1 'r\J IZ Copy: Department 

Office of Management & Budget 
Contract Management 
Clerk Finance 



CCPYFA 

ruLY 10,2012 

PROPOSAL 
FOR 

NASSAU COUNTY 
HUMAN RESOURCES 

RICOH MP5002SP COPIER 
PB3130 PAPER FEED UNIT 
SR3120 STAPLER/FINISHER 
BRIDGE UNIT BU3060 
PUNCH UNIT PU3000 
FAX OPTION TYPE 5502 

LEASE OPTIONS 

36 MONTHS@ $184.55 PER MONTI-I 

UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA #9-13-G ______. 
MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT 

BASE MONTHLY COST OF $130.00 INCLUDES 20,000 
BLACK & WHITE PRINTS. EXCESS BLACK & WHITE 
PRINTS AT $.0065 PER PRINT. INCLUDES ALL PARTS, 
LABOR, SERVICE CALLS AND SUPPLIES EXCEPT 
PAPER AND STAPLES. 

I 
h) 

:-: 

··.-;' 

RATE GUARANTEED FOR 36 MONTH TERM OF LEASE 

Jacksonville «<+ 
6631 N ExecullveParkCourt 
Sulte210 
Jacksonville, Fl32216 
Phone: 904.296.1600 
Fax: 904.296.7111 

Gainesville <«+ 
3210 SW 40th Blvd. 
SulteA-2 
Gainesville, FL 32608 
Phone: 352.336.1771 
Fax: 352.336.8151 

St. Augustine <«+ 
140 Gateway Circle 
Suite 1 
St. Johns, Fl32259 
Phone: 904.827.0178 
Fax: 904.208.5105 

Daytona Beach <«+ 
480 Fentress Blvd 
Suitel 
Daytona Beach, FL 32114 
Phone: 386.252.2292 
FaX! 386.252.0920 
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UNIVERSITY OF 
soUTH. FLOiUM 

• AW ARDEDI BIDS .• 

INVITATION TO NEGOTIATE NUMBER: 9-13-G 

Award To: 

Bell Techlogix, Inc. 

Dell Marketing L.P. 

Konica Minolta Business 
Solutions U.S.A.,. Inc. __ __,, __ . ~ 

CRicoh. ~ericas Corpo·rat~ 
Xerox Corporation 

BID TITLE:· Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional 
Printers 

Lot: 

Lot I 

Lot I 

Lot ·n 

Lots I & II 

Lots I & II 

--------··~·••~--~~ ~------•r·-.,~·-·••--- •-·•- •• -··•·~···-- ___ , __ ,_,_,._,_, ____ .. ___ ,._.... __ ~~.,.,_ .,,_, ---• •- -e~--·-- --

'· 



rN PROPOSAL TABULATION 
iN TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

[M NUMBER: ;,:.::9-_,_,13~-G,____ _______ _ 

IPENING DATE: May22, 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE Oc~ !~}. ~Qdq 

OSTING TIME/DATE h i 
FROM: 'C:..!>n f. /() .'lo/1/(11 

UNTIL: GfM I !(}~"JIQ~ 
PAGE: I OF Lj. PAGE(S) 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 

ITN COVER SIGNED 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED 

EEO SIGNED 

W9 SIGNED 

MINORITY·VENDOR 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) 

l)os,::tiM~_g_ 
NC' :@) .. 

~ NO 

I~YE~:; ,N(l 

@D· NO· 

ct~ . NO 

.GiV NO 

FAJ:LORE TO EILE A PROTEST l-liTHl:N TRE TIM£ PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120~57 (3) 1 

FLORIDA S~tr:l:ES, OR F~ TO P,OST 'l!HE BONP OR OTBER. SECORI'l:X BEQUIRED~ 
BY J.I';W WITHIN !IJEE · T:r:MI' ALLOWED' FOR Fn.:tNG A :SO~'D ,SHl\!.L CONSTI'roTE A WAI'IEB. 
OF P.ROC£EDINGS lJNDE~ ~ 120 1 FLORIDA STATOTES: ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS 
ACCEPTED Bl: THE STATE ARE .SOBJBCT TO THE ST.ATE·' S 'l'ERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY 
AND ALL ADDITIONA::> ::VERMS ~D COND:ETIONS SOBM!:TTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE 
RE..;:l"ECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS E'ROM THE VENDORS .LISTED 
E.EREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMS..Y AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND 
TIME. .ALL OTHER OFFERS S'OBM!TTED I'N RESPONSE TO TRIS. SOLICITATION1 IF ANY, :ffiE 
HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. 

::NG. BEQ'O:rnEMENT- ANY PERSON" WHO PILES AN 
iDED DECISION PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION 

AT THE Til$ OF FILING 'OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST NIT.li TEE UNIVERSITY' A 
B~NP PAYABLE TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN Al."10Uli!T EQU~ TO: 10 . 
PERCEN-T 'OF TEE ES';riMATED. VALUE PF THE. PROTESTOR'S BID QR PROPOSA!.: 10 PERCENT 
O.E: THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE. DOBING-·'I'HE CONTRACT Tf;RM: $10,000: OR 1\.'rlUCHEVER 
IS LESS. THE BOND SE:P!LL. BE CONDITIONED O'l?ON .TEE PAYMENT !JF ALL COSTS WE.ICH MAY 
BE ADVUDGED AGAI·NST Tl;lE CONTRACTOR PILING. THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A 
BOND1 THE UNIV"'...RSITY MA'l ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CBECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE P.MOONT 
OF THE BOND, FA.l:LURE TO FJ:LE ~BE PROPER :BOND A'!! TS:E !i!D:4E. OE' F:C:.:cNG :!:!EE FORM:AL 

SHALL UStr.r.T rN A, D.EN':CAL OF ~ =n'l'll!~'l' ... .,~.~~~ ....... ~.-~ 
l1e \\ <. · • : · ''DeJ \ ~1;~~l:>c;., . 
Teehnt'~\l~ . 1'>~\a.r-t~~/\g , %~~t,_.Jnex"s 

~~ . . . \ 
Co.\\(\'<.<!.'"'1-10{"\ 

cYiS) I NO ] (YESJ1~ \f, @§) 
" 

NO 
_,...."::5"-, 
~-~;l - NO 

"d~ NO ~ NO .·~ N.O NO. 

~S) NQ M~ NO :r~ NO NO 

YEY NO CYE£:) NO LYESJ NO NO 

~~. NO Yi' NO iciiD NO NO 
i 
" NO J§l NO l@v NO 

11. 
YES NO 

PROPOSAL CONTENT G;]) 1 io -~~~ 1 No t3\-No-·II<:EI/I NO 

YES I 
(5~ NO 

# PROPOSAL COPIEs \6~'¥i,f\<J :;l1~~t~ \or~~(\~, Lbe·~I2~Xot-~5i!'I~4®P~is~o.riq;,u;J i.feop;e-;, l -::..~~"-a.J . .!/ ex;p r~~" 
NO BID 'X'ES I . tj'O !I YES ' I NO ~! . YES j NO II YES I . NO YES NO 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 
~CT-j\ . U>T J. 

il 
. ....__ 

IPENED BY: Mark Lillguist rABuLArEo By: lJ•'-o.c& Sh~~,&e_ VERIFIED BY: _...,.. 

'EMARKS: C/RCL'ED PRIC.'E INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD, 
REV.S/7 !2008 



N TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi"Functional Printers. E'AILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE T~ 'PE.I!.'SCJ.U:.Bl!i.l:l ·~N !:$.tli;'l'iUN 
120.57 {3) t E'LORIDA S~S.r Qtt :e~;I:I.i'OBE .. ~0 l?OST TEE BOND OR OTEE:R 
s:ECOF.~TY BEQu;rnED l3Y :Ea1!< w:J:!L'Hm THE TIM£ ALLOWED FOR Fm1NG A BOND 
SHALL CONSTITUTE A w:AJ:V'ER OF PROCEEDINGS 'ONDER .cm:u?~ 120 1 FLORID.A 
S~OTES. ALL BIDS/l?.ROE'OSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SlJBJE:CT TO T.&'"E 
ST'A'l$ 1 S TERMS AND CONDI'l'IONS A1.TO ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TEEMS AND 
CONDIT.!ONS SUBMITT;ElD BY TREi BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ~ REJECTED Al."''!D SHALL nAVE 
NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OF.FERS FROM THE VENDORS 'LISTED HER&:l·N ARE THE ONLY 
0~ RECEIVED TIMELY' AS OF THE ABO\r"E 9i!?ENING l:/ATE Al.\1'0 TIME. ALL OTHER 
oFFERs SUBMI:I'TED IN RESPO:ti!SE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY 
REJECTED AS LATE. 

N NUMBER: 9"13-G 

PENING DATE: May 22. 2009 TIME 

WARDED DATE 

OSTING TIME/DATE 
FROM: I 

UNTIL: /.__~ 

PAGE: ~ OF L} 

3:00P.M. 

PAGE(S) 

P.:EQUIREME:N'l!- ~"n:' PERSON WRO PILES 
JED DECISION PERTAINING TO A 

SOLICITATION SHALL AT ~HE TIME OF FILING OF·THE FORV~ PROTEST1 POST 
tiiT.R 'I'BB UNI17ERSITY A BOND J;AYAB~E TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FL.ORIDA IN 
AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 EERCENT OF THE ESTIMA.T.ED VALUE OF TBE 
l?R01'E.STOR,'S BID OR PROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITU~ 
UURIN.G THE CONTRACT ·T'ERM: ~10,000: OR WH.ICF.E<V~R J:S LE::;S. TRE DOND SHALL 
BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAX BE .ADJUDGED 
AGAINS'T THE CONTRACTOR Fl:LJ:NG THE PROTES'r ACTION. IN LIEO OF A BOND, THE 
ONIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER 1 S CHECK OR 'MONEY ORDER IN THE AJ.""!OUNT OF 
THE BOND. ---­
PROTEST, 

oEsc...'UPT:roN/VENDoRS CoM'l•"l¢t"' l6o::.:'l<$" J::IC. i'tb.-/1 Gw, West- Ct:xls+ ).(tlt) · • /) ·, i . · l 
. . ~jytit)(JS Cop<e,:;:, Oraphu:;~s {""'\.I con I 

ITN COVER SIGNED ~ NO @ NO ,. YES c~ .~ NO ~ . NO 1 
ADDENDUM NQ, 1 SIGNED ~ , NO @) NO @J . NO · . ~ NO '-::iES5' NO : 

ADDENDUM NO" 2 SIGNED YES .@) . ~ NO YES .~. (YES) NO "~V NO ~ 
EEO SIGNED '(!E~ · NO ® NO . YES ( NO) @) NO . (~§) NO ! 
W9 SIGNED . (YE9 NO ~. NO ~~ .. NO c:@ NO.\ GED NO I 

MINORITY VENPOR ~ NO ~ NO YES f'"N'O'· ·,":"~. NO I ~ NO \ 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) ~ ~/ ·~ ~ I 

PROPOSAL CONTENT <::® NO ~ NO ~ NO @) · NO : Q.@. NO ~ 

#' PROPOSAL coPIEs J f- "'-/eo;::/,fl.S. ·I+ t/ Copies. I+- d.. czi.pies ! 4~ t/ (Op; es j1/ -Hf coPieS I 
NO BID YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO j YES NO ' 

. . UTJ .::r:+ IJ:. ~ 
DISQUALIFIED (REA.SON/S) . . I 

. ' I -· 
IPENED BY: Mark Lillguist 

j . ' . 
TABULATED BY: &--CU:,(l!fQ Sf:i·Q MJ.je, . VERIFIED BY: ~ 

!fMARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. REV.B/712008 

' 



'N TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

N NUMBER: "'9-_,.,13:::o·G,__ _______ _ 

PENING DATE: May 22. 2009 TIME 3:00 P.M. 

WARDED DATE·------.,--~--­
DSTING TIME/DATE 

FROM: / ____ _ 

UNTIL: · ~------,--

PAGE· 3 OF L~ PAGE(S) 

DESCRIPTION/~NDORS So'tl. '<-.rA-
ITN COVER SIGNED @]') NO 

KO<'I' c.a:. 
~>J\, 1. (')(;1\-\;:-J,. 

~· NO 

f'AIL'O:RE TO FILE ·A PROTEST Wii:THIN THE ~IME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 (3) 1 

FLORJDA STATUTES, OR FA:l:LURE TO POST TilE BO$ OR OTHER SEC!l:JRITY REQUIRJID 
BY :r,AW WITHIN .THE TIM£ ALLOWED FOR E'J:LING A BONO SRI\LL CONSTITO!'E A 
'WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS 'ONDER CHP.PTER 1.20, FLORIDA; S~S. ALL 
BIDS/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE A.."qE :stmJECT TO THE S?ATE 1 S TEBY..S AND 
CONDITIONS AN,D ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMIT'l'ED BY 'l'HE 
BIPDERS/PROl?O.SERB ARE REJEC'rED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OE'FE..~ 
FRO'M THE VENDORS LISTED EEREIN A-1'\E THE ONLX OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OE' TEE 
ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME~ ALir OTP...ER OFFERS SUBMITTED ·IN RESPONSE 'TO THIS 
SOLIC.I'l'A.TION 1 IF ANY, ARE .E-::EREBY REJECTED AS LATE •. 

Q~- ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN 
~CISIO~ PERTAINING TO A 

SOLU!ITATI0N SHALL· AT THE Tl·ME OF E'ILING OF THE FOBMAL PROTEST, POST WITR 
THE UNIVERSITY A BOND PA'l'ABDE 'rO TEE ONIVERS!'.!'~ OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN 
AMOUNT EQUAL 'l'O: 10 PERCENT OF "THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF 'THE PROTESTOR'S BID. 
OR P.ROPOSAL: lO· PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE· DDicrNG T.HE CONTRACT 
TEP.M: $10,000: .OR WE.ICHEVER IS· T..F:SS. THE BOND ·SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON TBE · 
PAYMENT OF Al;L COSTS WHICH Ml}.Y BE ADJUDGED AGAINST TEE CON'l':RAC'l'OR FILING. 
THE PROTEST ACTION. IN Ll.EU OF A BOND 1 .TEE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT Jl. ' 
CASHIER r S CHECK OR MONEIY ORDER IN THE: .AMOUNT OF THE :amm. FAILURE TO En 
TBE PRO"PER :SOND AT 'l'BE T:r:ME OF FJ:L'ING TEE FORMAL PROTEST, smLL :RES'OLT :eN . 
DENIAL. OE"" 1!BE PROTEST. 

-n::<'-l"~ 2z.i1CI Of\~r.,e. S\t.."'l.UO.::':\ 
. ";ue\-m · Go\v\iol)..'S: \ul\"'"\og_j &cQp 

·~ NO ~ NO ® NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED @) NO . ~S) NO YES @ YES C]9) ®J NO 

.ADDENDUM NO, 2 SIGNED YES ® ·~ . NO YES ®· YES . eEW @ NO 
. 

.. EEO SIGNED . !<:® NO ~ NO ~ NO GiV. NO @'-" .§J NO 

W9 SIGNED ~ NO . ~.· NO (~ NO {Ygs) NO C%D NO .,.._. 
~-.. ,. -~~~ MINORITY VENDOR ~ NO ·.@.) NO @) NO Q~_) NO ® NO 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) .--.. 
PROPOSAL CONTENT <@§) NO ~ NO" ~ NO YES NO 'Z~I NO 

# PROPOSAL COPIES . · l ttl (;j +· 14 .ee:{).~s. · I -r· 4 eopi<i'.!;. l + \ C.Of?'i l + 4 CDPi'fi.$ ! -r- t{ eo,pies 
NO BID YES NO ·YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 
.e..~;- . ..t.L.. 

' 

Mark Lillguist L . 81) reJie, r.: a.zan;'-- , .n · 

EMARKS: CIRCLED PRICEJNDJCATES INTENT r.o AWARD. 
REV.817/2.008 



TN PROPOSAL TABULATION 
fN TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

fN NUMBER: ,_9·""'13'-'-G"---------­

lPENING DATE: May 22, 2009 TIME 3:00 P.M. 

lWARDED DATE ___________ -.:. 

'OSTJI'fG TIME/DATE . 
FROM: 1-,.---,----

UNTIL: ! ____ _ 

'' , .......... L[ 
~· 

L(. 
t"KI::>C\~L -

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 

. 

"'/,_e.fo;Z . . . 

<@!) 
. ' 

. . ITN COVER SIGNED NO YES 
. . . 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED (YEs} .. NO .·' YES 
r 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGl\IED Q!§/. NO YES 

EEO SIGNED · I (I YES:_) NO· .,. YES 

W9 SIGNED .~ NO r 
' 

YES 

MINORITY· VENDOR. .@ 
'1 

. NO 
, 
·· YES 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) 

PROPOSAL CONTENT '<§) NO ! YES 
I 

# PROPOSAl COPIES I 4· Ljep.p;es 
NO BID yES NO· .. YES 

Lc7"'..! .L:.l"J:i: 

DISQUAliFIED (REASON/S) 

.. 

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTES'T l'TITE.:tN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 (3) 1 
FLORIDA S~$r. OR E'AILURE: TO POS':C ~EE BOND . 0..~ OTHER SEC'OR.!'I!Y REQUIBED .. 
EY LAW WI!I:HIN mE. = l\LLOWED· FOR FILING A BOND SEALL COt;S~!= A 'W1\.J:\13R 
0F PROCEEDlNGS ONDER CH:APT.ER ;1..20, FLORIDA STATUTES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS "'. 
ACCEPTED BY TEE STATE AlUl.· SOB.P....CIJ' '1'0 THE. STATErS TERMS .l'Ul'D CONDITIONS AND ANY 
m:!D AL:r;. ADDITIONAL TEIU<lS AND CONDITIONS SUEM!TTBD B1: THE BIDDERS/P.ROPOSC::..'t\5 ARE 
REJECTED Z>.ND SHALL HAVE: NO FORCE AND EFFECT~ .OFFERS F.RQM 'l'HE VENDORS LISTED 
HEREIN ARE. TF.E .O~Y OFFER's RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE JffiOVE OJ?ENING DATE AND 
T!ME~ ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED ,IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICI-:I:ATION, !F ANY, ARE 
HEREBY REJ!OCTED AS LATE. 

ANY PERSON WED FILES AN 
PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION. 

SaALL AT THE TIME OF· FI.tiNG OF 'I'l!E FORMAir PROTEST, POST 'WITH TBE. UNIVERSITY A 
BOND PAYABLE .TO 'mE QNiv;EBSI'l'Y O:E' SOUTH .F!.ORIDA IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 . 
BERCENT a: TEE ESTIMATED V~UE OF TEE PROTESTOR'S BID OR ?RO~OSAL; 10 PERCENT 
OF THE ESTIMATED EXPEND!tURS DURING' THE CONTRACT TERM: $10 1 000: OR WHICHEVER 
IS LESS .• THE BOND SHM.L BE CONDITIONED UE'ON ':CE.E E'AYMENT OJ:' ALL COSTS. WHIC:S. ll11\.."! 
BE ~JUDGED AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST A~ON. IN LIEU OF A 
BOJ\"Dr. THE tWIVERS!TY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER 1 S CEECK OR MONEY ORDER IN 'l'R'B AMOON'l" 
OF IJ:BE. BOND. PAJ:LURE 'ro, FII..E TEE FitOl?ER BOliD M o:l1HE 'l:IME OE' FILING THE lr{JRMA!. 
..~ .......... - ....... _, ........ -..... 'L s:e:SULT-:tN A DEN:CAL OF THE PROTEST·. 

NO YES NO YES .. NO ·.·YES NO 

NO YES. NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO ! YES NO .. 
NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

. 
NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO yES NO 

NO YES :NO · YES NO YES NO 
-

)PENED BY: Mark Lillguist 
L cl. ~_[e TABULATED BY.:(.J.,U(Q ....,,.:hf)l;t;: 1! VERIFIEQBY:. ________ _ 

?EMARKS: CFRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. 
REV.8f7/2008 


